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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided a@er the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date: October 2012 Pages: 148 Language: Chinese in Publisher:
Xiamen University Press textbook of the 12th Five-Year Plan of Fujian Province. vocational agriculture. forestry.
animal husbandry and fisheries major categories: economic bamboo species high yield eEicient cultivation
techniques focuses on economic overview of the bamboo species cultivation. economic bamboo species
morphological characteristics and the physical and chemical nature. economic bamboo all the class to identify
growth law of economic bamboo species suitable environment. Moso bamboo eEicient cultivation technology.
small and medium-sized scattered bamboo eEicient cultivation technology. tu@ed bamboo eEicient cultivation
technology. mixed raw Bamboo eEicient cultivation techniques. the green cultivation techniques of economic
bamboo species. economic bamboo species pest control technology. economic bamboo species planning and
design of eEicient cultivation techniques. Textbook of the 12th Five-Year Plan of Fujian Province. vocational
agriculture. forestry. animal husbandry and fishery broad categories: economic bamboo species high yield
eEicient cultivation techniques closely linked to the actual production. writing content-rich. easy to operate.
reasonable structure. Total onwards. a@er each chapter summaries. exercises closely what they learn to help
learners master critical knowledge and skills to improve learning eEiciency. 12th Five-Year Plan materials of
Fujian higher vocational agriculture. forestry. animal husbandry and fisheries major categories: economic
bamboo species high yield eEicient cultivation techniques applies to vocational technical colleges forestry.
landscape. gardening technology professional professional secondary vocational schools can be applied.
engaged in the cultivation of bamboo industry and landscape planning and design. landscaping and other staff
use and reference. but also as professional training and related trades Grading and rural practical technical
training books. Contents: Chapter 1 Economic Bamboo cultivation Overview 1.1 Economic Bamboo cultivation
significance 1.1.1 fast growth 1.1.2 high yield. effective...
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